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Text Messaging 

 
Prime 16 utilizes technologies made available through Venture Technologies and Twilio to 

provide users with the ability to text clients.  This new texting feature is very easy to use in Prime.   
 

Organizations can easily set up an account with Twilio, including purchasing a phone line.  
Settings within Twilio are set to point to a website made available within Venture Technologies 

to allow the update of text messages (such as whether the text was sent and delivered).  Within 
Prime, input appropriate Twilio account information: 

 

 
 

The setup is then complete.  The “Text Response” entry is what is returned to a person, should 
they send a text to your Twilio phone number.  The “Call Reponse” entry is what would be spoken 

to the caller, should they call your Twilio phone number. 

 
Within the client record a new checkbox indicates whether the client has indicated it is okay to 

text to his cell number.  If that box is not checked, the system will not text the client.  Additionally 
some basic checks are performed of the cell area code and phone number to ensure they are an 

appropriate format.  The cell area code should be a number, three digits long.  The cell phone 
number should be in a format of XXX-XXXX: 

 

 
 



Pressing the “Send Text” button causes the text form to appear for entry of a text message: 

 

 
 
The “Quick Entry” drop down allows for the quick selection of a variety of standard text messages.  

Once selected, the message can be customized to include information such as meeting times, 
phone numbers to calls, etc.  A text message can also be typed in the “Text Message” field. 

 
To conform to standard text message requirements, only 160 characters are allowed.  As a 
message is typed, the total characters used and those remaining is displayed.  Once 160 
characters is reached, no additional input is allowed: 
 

 
 
Pressing the “Send Message” button causes Prime to contact Twilio and request the text message 

be sent.  The client should then receive the message: 
 

 



 

Prime tells staff whether the message was accepted and the current status of that text message: 
 

 
 
Pressing the “Texts” button in the client record will bring up the text messages that have been 
sent in a case: 
 

 
 
Within a text message, the “Message Status” will show the status of the message from Twilio: 
 

 
 



A status of queued is the initial status, indicating that Twilio has accepted the text message and 

will attempt to send it.  A sent status indicates Twilio has  sent the text message.  Finally, a 
delivered status indicates that Twilio believes the message has been delivered to the recipient.  

A delivered status is not always provided.  Some cell phone providers do not provide that kind of 
information.  At best, an organization can only know that Twilio sent the text message.  [Delivery 

should never be assumed, even with a delivered status.] 
 

Twilio sends updates of text message status to the Venture Technologies website responsible for 
updating that information in Prime. 
 
If a client texts to the Twilio phone number, Twilio queries the Venture Technologies website 
requesting instructions on what it should do.  The website queries Prime for the information 
entered in the Twilio setup.  The response text is returned to Twilio and then sent to the client 
as a text message. 
 

If a client texts “STOP”, “CANCEL”, or “END” back to the number, Twilio sends that notification to 

the Venture Technologies website. The website updates Prime to indicate that cell number no 
longer wishes to receive text messages.  This effectively unchecks the checkbox on the client 

record.  Twilio also blocks the attempt to send text messages to that number again and the client 
is notified of that: 
 

 
 
 
If the client decides later they do want to receive text messages, they can text “YES” or “START” 

to the number.  Twilio sends that notification to the website and it updates the checkbox 
indicating it is okay to text to that number.  Twilio will start allowing texts to that number again.  

 



 
 

If a client calls the Twilio phone number, Twilio queries the Venture Technologies website 
requesting instructions on what it should do.  The website queries Prime for the information 
entered in the Twilio setup.  The response text is returned to Twilio.  Twilio then speaks that 
message to the client. 


